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Keith Urban brings “Graffiti U World Tour 2018” to Grand Rapids on October 19 

Tickets go on sale March 2 at 10:00 AM at Ticketmaster.com. 
 

Grand Rapids — Four-time Grammy Award winner Keith Urban will bring his “GRAFFITI U WORLD TOUR 
2018” to Van Andel Arena in Grand Rapids on Friday, October 19, 2018 at 7:30 PM. The tour will feature 
special guest Kelsea Ballerini as Urban’s supporting act.  
 
Tickets go on sale to the general public beginning Friday, March 2 at 10 AM. Ticket prices are $39, $65.50, 
and $96.50, and tickets will be available at the Van Andel Arena and DeVos Place® box offices, online at 
Ticketmaster.com, and charge by phone at 1-800-745-3000. A purchase limit of eight (8) tickets will apply to all 
orders and prices are subject to change. 
 
The 58-city tour will kick off in June and run through November. Urban’s shows have become concert events 
that electrify. They’re unexpected, if not unpredictable, and have been hailed by media around the world as a 
“concert experience not to be missed.” The tour will feature many of Urban’s 23 #1 songs, as well as brand new 
songs that have never been performed live and an all-new concert production that promises to be as spectacular 
as never before.  
 
“I’ve been full-on writing, recording, collaborating and creating with some incredibly talented people for GRAFFITI 
U, a lot of whom I’ve never worked with before,” said Urban.  “I can hear how some of the songs will translate 
live already, which really makes putting on a new show so exhilarating and I loved having our fans included in 
the announcement of the tour because it’s their tour too.”  
 
“I remember hearing Keith Urban songs that stopped me in my tracks and made me want to drop everything and 
chase that kind of lyric and heart-filled artistry,” says Ballerini. “He’s the best in the business and I can’t wait to 
fangirl and learn from him this year. Truly an honor to tour with him.”  
 
For all official Keith Urban tour news including show dates and where to purchase tickets, go to 
www.keithurban.net. 
 
About SMG 
Van Andel Arena is managed by SMG. SMG provides management services to more than 230 public assembly 
facilities including convention and exhibition centers, arenas, stadiums, theaters, performing arts centers, 
amphitheaters, equestrian facilities, science centers and a variety of other venues. With facilities across the 
globe, SMG manages more than 15 million square feet of exhibition space and more than 1.5 million sports and 
entertainment seats. As the recognized global industry leader, SMG provides venue management, sales, 
marketing, event booking and programming; construction and design consulting; and pre-opening services for 
such landmark facilities as McCormick Place & Soldier Field in Chicago, Moscone Convention Center in San 
Francisco, Houston’s NRG Park and the Mercedes-Benz Superdome in New Orleans. SMG also offers food and 
beverage operations through its concessions and catering companies, currently serving more than 140 accounts 
worldwide. For more information visit www.smgworld.com. 
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