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Your partner for training and emergency - part 1 
Onsite and online: Bullard's TI-Training 
 
Firefighters need to stay fit. This not only applies to their own physical 
condition – after all, if you want to save lives and remain unharmed, you 
also need to master all the important procedures and processes in the 
field. The key: professional and realistic training. 
            
Bullard's QXT Thermal Imager is regularly used when the emergency is 
being rehearsed in Ense, North Rhine-Westphalia, and the flames are 
blazing in the Bullard Fire Training Camp fire container. "The thermal 
imaging camera fits perfectly in the hand and provides the clear images 
that are so enormously important for assessing the situation," says Thomas 
Meier, co-owner of the recently opened local training center. 
  
The Northern FireFighting Training Center (N.F.T.C.) in Bad Zwischenahn, 
Lower Saxony, will also be equipped with the QXT. In addition, the Bullard 
H3000 Series firefighter helmets are also in use. In the facility's smoke 
ignition system – one of the largest of its kind in northern Germany – 
firefighters can practice various extinguishing techniques, for example, and 
thus prepare for an emergency under realistic conditions. And under the 
guidance of Chief Instructor Matthias Riedel, firefighters train just as hard in 
the Boeing 747 fire simulator at the Fire Training training center at Leipzig 
Halle airport as in the lumber lighted fire container and on the 50-meter 
respiratory protection range. 
  
And what if training on-site is not possible? The National Fire Brigade 
Association of Rhineland-Palatinate will expand existing training 
opportunities with digital offerings. Bullard also strives to improve your 
safety in everyday life, contributing with innovative solutions. For Bullard, it 
is consistent to support the entire range of options with which you can 
prepare for deployment – whether on-site or independent of location. After 
all, our products can only show their strengths to the fullest if you are able 
to prepare yourself in time to use them properly. 
 
At Bullard, you not only get the right tool, but you also learn how to use it. 
We are fortunate to have such supportive partners that keep you 
connected with Bullard. 


