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Woodford 67 series are the best-
selling commercial wall hydrants 
in the nation. With good reason.

They drain automatically, even 
with a hose attached. They’re 
high flow and maintenance-free. 
They have fewer parts to wear 
out than competitive hydrants. 
And they won’t freeze.

They’re guaranteed for five 
years. They set the standard 
other faucets can only hope 
to reach.

WOODFORD MANUFACTURING 
COMPANY, LLC.
Excellence. Always.
800.621.6032 • www.woodfordmfg.com

SETTING THE
STANDARD.
Woodford 67 series are the best-
selling commercial wall hydrants 
in the nation. With good reason.

They drain automatically, even 
with a hose attached. They’re 
high flow and maintenance-free. 
They have fewer parts to wear 
out than competitive hydrants. 
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STANDARD.
Model 67 
Freezeless Wall Hydrant

ASSE 1052 approved field 
testable double check backflow 
preventer and vacuum breaker

RB67 Freezeless Wall Hydrant 

Ideal for 6" core drill applications 
and tilt-up wall construction

B67 Freezeless Wall Hydrant 

Lockable box secures hydrant

B67 Freezeless Wall Hydrant 


