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Product Description 

Combi Foam is a strongly formulated product that 
quickly removes baked-on, or greasy soils from a 
range of hard surfaces. This can be applied neat for 
maximum effect, or diluted up to 1:40 (25ml/L) for 
less heavy-duty applications. 
  
Combi Foam contains foaming detergents to assist 
with soil removal, surface wetting and surface cling 
to prolong contact times.  
 

Applications 

Combi Foam is designed to clean stainless steel, 
steel and enamelled surfaces. It should not be used 
on aluminium surfaces such as range hood filters. 
  
Combi Foam is ideal for use in liquid-fed Combi 
ovens and should be used as per the machine 
manufacturers cleaning instructions. 
  
Allow equipment to cool below 80°C before using 
Combi Foam, then apply to warm surface in neat or 
diluted form and allow to react for a few minutes. To 
clean large areas such as industrial deep fryers use 
Combi Foam through a foamer.  
  
Agitate using a brush or scourer pad then rinse off 
with plenty of water.  
  
Food contact surfaces such as grill plates can be 
rinsed with water, then a dilute acidic solution, to 
ensure all alkaline residues are removed.  
  
To clean deep fryers, empty out the oil and fill with 
water. Add Combi Foam at a rate of 1:40 (25 ml/L) in 
water and heat to near boiling. Leave to soak, then 
empty and rinse with water and dry before refilling 
with oil.  
 

Technical Data 

Combi Foam is based on potassium hydroxide and 
ablend of water softening agents, dispersants and 
biodegradable detergents for effective cleaning. 

Combi Foam is strongly alkaline with a pH of 14 in 
the neat form.   Do not use on aluminium, galvanised, 
enamelled or painted surfaces.  
 

Pack Sizes 

(2x5L Bottle) C10316 
 

Dominant Colour Code 

 
 

Hazard Information & Safety 

Classified as Hazardous according to the criteria of 
the SafeWork Australia, utilising GHS.  A Safety Data 
Sheet for this product is available at 
www.dominant.com.au/sds 
 
Danger  
 
May be corrosive to metals. 
Causes severe skin burns and eye damage. 
 
Poisons Schedule: S6. Poison 
Dangerous Goods: 8 
 
 
 

Recommended PPE 

Wear: GLOVES, CHEMICAL GOGGLES when 
handling. 
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