
Fountain Park Way, London W12
Asking price £3,750,000 Leasehold





Description
Introducing a magnificent 4 bedroom, 4 bathroom penthouse
located on the 12th floor, boasting dual aspect floor-to-ceiling
window panels that allows the spacious living area flooding in
natural light - seamlessly connected to the dining and kitchen
spaces. Savour the stunning city views from the south-facing
private terrace and 2 balconies, providing a peaceful haven
amidst the energetic cityscape. Retreat to one of the 4
luxurious bedrooms, each featuring an en-suite bathroom and
panoramic views. Additional benefits include allocated parking
spaces for 2 cars.

White City Living offers residents a multitude of amenities,
including 24-hour security, concierge services, CCTV
surveillance, lift access, a lounge, meeting room, reading area,
swimming pool, spa, gym, communal gardens, and a high-spec
cineplex.

White City is an up-and-coming neighbourhood located in West
London that had undergone substantial regeneration. Well-
connected with excellent transportation options, including the
White City and Wood Lane Underground stations, providing
easy access to central London. It is also adjacent to Westfield
shopping centre, one of Europe's largest shopping complex,
offering a wide range of retail and entertainment options.

= Penthouse

= 4 Bedrooms

= 4 Bathrooms

= Private roof terrace and 2 balconies

= 2282 sq ft / 212 sq m

= 2 Allocated parking spaces

= 0.1 mile to Wood Lane station

= 0.2 miles to White City station

= EPC B



Floorplan
2,282 sq ft  │ 212 sq m
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